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 JACKSON PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT 

Jackson, Mississippi 
Date:  September 05, 2023 

Board of Trustees 
Jackson Public School District 
Jackson, Mississippi 
 
Ladies and Gentlemen: 
 
Presented for your review on the attached page(s) are the bid tabulations for the formal 
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Superintendent of Schools 
 
Information about the Content and Formatting of the Attached Bid Tabulation 
Sheet(s) 
Pursuant to the legal requirements as outlined in the Mississippi Code 1972, Annotated, 
§31-7-13(d), all bid proposals received were compared to the written bid specifications and 
the recommendation to purchase or for rejection is indicated on the following pages, as per 
the manner prescribed below. 
 
 
Recommendation to Purchase: 
The recommendation to purchase from or award a contract to any vendor, is indicated on 
the attached tabulation sheet(s) by placing “Low Bid” to the right of the vendor’s 
name/pricing and bolding the information. 

 
 
Rejection of an Item or an Entire Bid: 
The law requires that the District clearly state why in each instance that the lowest bid 
received is not the recommended “lowest and best” bid.  The specific reason that an item 
or service, or a vendor’s entire bid proposal, must be deemed "irregular" or “non-
compliant” with the written bid specifications and therefore cannot be recommended for 
purchase, is indicated on the attached tabulation sheet(s) by drawing a line through the 
vendor’s name/pricing and indicating the rejection reason beside the item. 
 
 
U
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RFP 2023-14 (6-13-23) ï Digital/ Print Curriculum for K-12 Core 
Curriculum Resources English/ Language Arts, Math, Science, & 
Social Studies 
Funding Source:  ESSER Funds  
Recommendation: Dr. Kimberly Smith  
 

 Vendor Location Amount 

N Bedford, Freeman & Worth 
Publishing Group, LLC 

New York, NY $TBD  

N Cengage Group, Inc. Farmington Hills, MI  $TBD 

N Great Minds PBC Washington, DC $183,511.47 

N Teacher’s Discovery Auburn Hills, MI $TBD 

N Savvas Learning Co., LLC Paramus, NJ $34,053.03 

N Wilson Language Training 
Corp 

Oxford, MA $95,785.16 

N Gutenberg, Inc dba 
Universal Publishing 

Waymart, PA $8.50 Per Student 

W Just Right Reader, Inc. San Francisco, CA $1575.00 Per 
Single Library 

W Grade Results, Inc. Carrollton, TX $232,000.00 

N Thinking Nation Corp. Northridge, CA $83,303.04 Per 
Year 

N Accelerate Learning, Inc. Houston, TX $793,920.58 

N 





5 

 

 

Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 2 HP 840 G10 I5-1335U 512 16 $911.00  

KIBS 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4 $1,246.00  

Riverside 
Technologies 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4 

 $ 
1,494.00  

Jackson Business 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4  No Bid  

Howard 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4  No Bid  

Trafera 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4  No Bid  

RJ Young 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4  No Bid  

Clary 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4  No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4  No Bid  

Archangel Tablets 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4  No Bid  

Synergetics DCS 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4  No Bid  

 
The warranty for the alternate device proposed by CDWG includes only one ADP repair 
for the coverage of the device. The bid specifications required unlimited repairs. 
 

Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 
Price  

KIBS 3 
Lenovo Universal ThinkPad USB-C 
Dock  $185.00  

Riverside 
Technologies 3 

Lenovo Universal ThinkPad USB-C 
Dock  $199.00  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 
Price  

CDWG 4 HP 440 G9 I5-12500 256 8  $689.00  

KIBS115.58 14.52 re

W* n

BTDWG
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 
Price  

Riverside 
Technologies 6 

Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 
(Intel)  $405.00  

Archangel Tablets 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  $465.89  

KIBS 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  $506.00  

CDWG 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  $522.00  

Jackson Business 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  No Bid  

Howard 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  No Bid  

Trafera 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  No Bid  

RJ Young 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  No Bid  

Clary 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  No Bid  

Synergetics DCS 6 Lenovo 500e Chromebook Gen 4 (Intel)  No Bid  

 

Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Clary 7 
OneScreen TL7-65 (Includes fixed 
Wall Mount $1,795.00  

Academic 
Technologies 7 SMART Board SBID-MX265-V4 $2,417.00  

RJ Young 7 SMART Board SBID-MX265-V4 $4,062.78  

Jackson Business 7 SMART Board SBID-MX265-V4  No Bid  

KIBS 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Clary 8 

OneScreen TL7-75 (Includes fixed wall 
mount) • 75" touch screen with Android 
11, 8GB RA $1,895.00  

Academic 
Technologies 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4 $2,975.00  

RJ Young 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4 $5,173.89  

Jackson Business 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4  No Bid  

KIBS 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4  No Bid  

Howard 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4  No Bid  

Trafera 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4  No Bid  

Riverside Technologies 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4  No Bid  

CDWG 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4  No Bid  

Archangel Tablets 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4  No Bid  

Synergetics DCS 8 SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4  No Bid  

 
Clary did not include detailed quotes as required by the bid specifications. 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Clary 9 

OneScreen TL7-65 (Includes mobile 
fixed height cart $1,85.00  

Academic 
Technologies 9 

SMART Board SBID-MX265-V4 
(includes mobile fixed height stand)  $2,867.00 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Clary 10 

OneScreen TL7-75 (Includes mobile 
fixed height cart) $1,995.00  

Academic 
Technologies 10 

SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4 
(includes mobile fixed height stand) $3,425.00  

RJ Young 10 

SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4 
(includes mobile fixed height stand) $5,689.11  

Jackson Business 10 

SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4 
(includes mobile fixed height stand)  No Bid  

KIBS 10 

SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4 
(includes mobile fixed height stand)  No Bid  

Howard 10 

SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4 
(includes mobile fixed height stand) 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Clary 11 

OneScreen TL7-65 (Includes Electric 
Height Adjustable Mobile cart) $2,495.00  

Academic 
Technologies 11 

SMART Board SBID-MX265-V4 
(includes mobile electric height 
adjustable stand) $3,567.00  

RJ Young 11 

SMART Board SBID-MX265-V4 
(includes mobile electric height 
adjustable stand) $5,577.89  

Jackson Business 11 

SMART Board SBID-MX265-V4 
(includes mobile electric height 
adjustable stand)  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Clary 12 

OneScreen TL7-75 (Includes Electric 
Height Adjustable Mobile cart) $2,595.00  

Academic 
Technologies 12 

SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4 
(includes mobile electric height 
adjustable stand) $4,125.00  

RJ Young 12 

SMART Board SBID-MX275-V4 
(includes mobile electric height 
adjustable stand) 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Trafera 13 ActivePanel LX Option $1,685.00  

Clary 13 
OneScreen TL7-65 (Includes fixed Wall 
Mount $1,795.00  

Trafera 13 
Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 ï 65ò 
4K $2,090.00  

Synergetics DCS 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K $2,276.18  

Jackson Business 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

KIBS 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

Howard 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

RJ Young 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 13 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
 No Bid  

Riverside 
Technologies 13 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
 No Bid  

CDWG 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

Archangel Tablets 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

 
Clary did not include detailed quotes as required by the bid specifications. 
 
The alternate ActivePanel LX proposed by Trafera did not meet the bid specifications. 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Clary 16 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes fixed height mobile stand)  $1,995.00  

Trafera 16 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes fixed height mobile stand)  $2,445.00  

Trafera 16 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 ï 75ò 
4K (includes fixed height mobile 
stand)  $3,275.00  

Synergetics DCS 16 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes fixed height mobile stand)  

 $ 
3,339.41  

Jackson Business 16 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes fixed height mobile stand)   No Bid  

KIBS 16 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes fixed height mobile stand)   No Bid  

Howard 16

�±–75” 4K 

 

No Bid �����´�� ���.��(includes fixed height mobile stand) 

 
No Bid  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 17 Newline 65" 4K UHD LED $1,913.85  

Clary 17 
OneScreen TL7-65 (Includes Electric Height 
Adjustable Mobile cart) $2,495.00  

Trafera 17 ActivePanel LX Option 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 18 
Newline 75" 4K UHD LED 

$2,338.85  

Clary 18 

OneScreen TL7-75 (Includes Electric Height 
Adjustable Mobile cart) $2,595.00  

Trafera 18 
ActivePanel LX Option 

$3,029.00  

Trafera 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 ï 75ò 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand) $3,859.00  

Synergetics DCS 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand) $3,936.41  

Jackson 
Business 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

KIBS 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Howard 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

RJ Young 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Riverside 
Technologies 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Archangel 
Tablets 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

 
CDWG did not include detailed quotes required by the bid specifications. 
 
Clary did not include detailed quotes as required by the bid specifications. 
 
The alternate ActivePanel LX proposed by Trafera did not meet the bid specifications. 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  $575.00  

RJ Young 19 Brother HL-L6400dwx  $580.00  

Riverside 
Technologies 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  $925.00  

Jackson Business 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  $968.00  

Howard 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer $1,077.00  

KIBS 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  No Bid  

Trafera 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  No Bid  

Clary 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  No Bid  

Archangel Tablets 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  No Bid  

Synergetics DCS 19 Xerox VersaLink B400 B/W Printer  No Bid  

 
CDWG did not include the three-year warranty as required by the bid specifications. 
 
The alternate printer proposed by RJ Young did not meet the specifications outlined in 
the bid.  The toner cartridge, tray, and drum are not equivalent to the specified printer. 
 

Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 
Price  

CDWG 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer  $540.00  

RJ Young 20 Brother HL-L9310cdw  $832.00  

Riverside 
Technologies 20 

Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color 
Printer  $881.00  

Jackson Business 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer 
 $ 
895.00  

Howard 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer 
 $ 
976.00  

KIBS 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer  No Bid  

Trafera 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer  No Bid  

Clary 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer  No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer  No Bid  

Archangel Tablets 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer  No Bid  

Synergetics DCS 20 Xerox Versalink C400/DN Color Printer  No Bid  

 
CDWG did not include the three-year warranty as required by the bid specifications. 
 
The alternate printer proposed by RJ Young did not meet the specifications outlined in 
the bid.  The toner cartridge, tray, and drum are not equivalent to the specified printer. 
 
 



20 

 

 

Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 
Price  

Synergetics DCS 21 
DELL Chromebook 65-Watt Type-C 
AC Adapter   $47.99  

Riverside 
Technologies 21 

DELL Chromebook 65-Watt Type-C AC 
Adapter   $48.35  

CDWG 21 
DELL Chromebook 65-Watt Type-C AC 
Adapter   $48.42  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 
Price  

Riverside 
Technologies 23 

HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   $40.00  

Synergetics DCS 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   $51.69  

Howard 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   $58.00  

CDWG 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   $66.60  

Jackson Business 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   No Bid  

KIBS 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   No Bid  

Trafera 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   No Bid  

RJ Young 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   No Bid  

Platinum Micro 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   No Bid  

Clary 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 23 

HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   No Bid  

Archangel Tablets 23 
HP 45W Chromebook Adapter with 
power cord   No Bid  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 
Price  

CDWG 27 ViewSonic VP3256-4K - 32"   $475.00  

Platinum Micro 27 ViewSonic VP3256-4K - 32"   $491.47  

Howard 27 ViewSonic VP3256-4K - 32"   $502.00  

Riverside 
Technologies 27 ViewSonic VP3256-4K - 32"   $505.00  

Synergetics DCS 27 ViewSonic VP3256-4K - 32"   $515.71  

RJ Young 27 ViewSonic VP3256-4K - 32"   $649.15  

Jackson Business 27 ViewSonic VP3256-4K - 32"   No Bid  

KIBS 27 ViewSonic VP3256-4K - 32"   No Bid  

Trafera

 

 

  

4emic1 14.52 re

f*

249.05 67529.1Tm

0 G

0.48

f*

457.54 98 0.48 re

f*

72.024 584.98 0.4831.430.78 0.47998 14.52 re

f*

 EMC q

72.504 644.98 115.58 25.32 r529.1Tm

0 G

0.48

f*

457.54 98 0.48 re

f*

72.024 584644.98 831.430.78 0.47998 14.52 re

f*

 EMC q

72.504 569.29.1Tm4.98 115.5

f*

457.54 741.12 55.584 0.ng (en-US)>> BDC q

72.504 614..29.1Tm4.98 115.5

f*

457.54 T

/F3 11.04 Tf

1 0 0 1 77.664 5731.430.78 0.479 G

[(K)4(I)-4(B)4(S)] TJ

ET

Q

q

72.29.1Tm4.98 115.5

f*

457.54 T

/F3 11.04 Tf

1 0 0 1 77 0 1 1131.430.78 0.47998 14.52 re

f*

 EMC q

72.49.29 5829.1Tm
W* n

BT



f*

457.54 741.12 55.584 0.CID 25/Lang (en-US)>> BDC q

18829.1Tm
W* n

BT



f*

457.54 9856



26 

 

RFP 2023-12 (05-10-23) Online and Blended Learning  
Funding Source: 
Recommendation: Dr. Laketia Marshall-Thomas 

 

 


